



**MILWAUKEE
PUBLIC SCHOOLS**

**RFP 879 Bussing Services for MPS Students
(Special Services)
Opening Date: January 29, 2015**

Final Tabulation
APPENDIX C2

VENDOR*		PRICING QUOTED			
		Base	Hourly	Mileage	
Dairyland Bus Lines, Inc.	Northwest	No Bid			29 Diesel buses
	Central	\$116.70	\$18.25	\$.56	
	East	116.70	18.25	.56	
	South	No Bid			
First Student, Inc	Northwest	158.22	19.41	.90	65 buses
	Central	158.22	19.41	.90	
	East	158.22	19.41	.90	
	South	158.22	19.41	.90	
Lakeside Buses of Wisconsin, Inc.	Northwest	116.70	18.25	.56	36 Diesel buses
	Central	116.70	18.25	.56	
	East	No Bid			
	South	No Bid			
Lamers Bus Lines, Inc.	Northwest	No Bid			18 buses
	Central	No Bid			
	East	No Bid			
	South	275.00	18.50	.34	

Awards marked in yellow have been approved by the Board.