

Cumulative Score Sheet

RFP 893

Remediation and Acceleration of Online Credited Courses for Students in Grades 6 through 12

Proposal Due Date: June 24, 2015

After preliminary scoring was tabulated, for the “with remote teacher” solution, Edgenuity, Inc. was awarded six (6) substantive subject areas: (1) credit recovery; (2) world languages; (3) advanced placement; (4) core academics (5) electives; and (6) general education development (“GED”).

With regards to the “without remote teacher” solution, the two highest scoring respondents from selected substantive areas – Edgenuity, Inc. and NCS Pearson, Inc. – were invited to provide more comprehensive presentations to the evaluation committee.

Those presentations took place on October 6, 2015. Based on these presentations, each of the nine committee members identified its preferred respondent (see below).

Respondent	Preference								Total	
Edgenuity, Inc.		X	X		X	X		X	5	
NCS Pearson, Inc.	X			X			X		X	4

For the “without remote teacher” option, Edgenuity, Inc. was awarded six (6) substantive subject areas: (1) credit recovery; (2) world languages; (3) advanced placement; (4) core academics (5) electives; and (6) general education development (“GED”).

English as a second language was not awarded as part of RFP 893.

Scoring for the substantive areas without remote teacher begins on page 2.

Scoring for the substantive areas with remote teacher begins on page 9.

Cumulative Score Sheet  
RFP 893  
Online Credited Courses  
Proposal Due Date: June 24, 2015

**Advanced Placement without Remote Teacher**

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Edgenuity, Inc.	1	5	5	10	15	15	10	13	6.98
	2	5	5	10	15	15	10	15	6.98
	3	4	4	9	13	14	8	12	6.98
	4	5	4	10	13	15	9	13	6.98
	5	5	5	10	15	14	10	15	6.98
	6	5	5	10	15	7	10	12	6.98
	7	5	2	8	8	8	5	0	6.98
	8	5	5	5	12	15	10	15	6.98
	9	5	4	7	10	12	7	7	6.98

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Fuel Education, LLC	1	5	4	9	13	15	10	14	2.82
	2	5	5	10	15	10	10	15	2.82
	3	4	4	9	14	13	10	10	2.82
	4	5	5	10	13	15	8	15	2.82
	5	5	5	10	10	10	8	10	2.82
	6	5	5	10	10	10	5	12	2.82
	7	3	4	6	5	5	3	7	2.82
	8	5	5	5	11	15	10	15	2.82
	9	5	4	7	5	12	8	10	2.82

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
NCS Pearson, Inc.	1	5	3	9	12	15	10	13	11.35
	2	5	4	10	14	7	9	14	11.35
	3	5	4	8	13	14	10	12	11.35
	4	5	4	10	13	14	8	13	11.35
	5	5	5	10	10	8	8	10	11.35
	6	5	3	8	10	8	5	8	11.35
	7	5	4	8	12	10	5	7	11.35
	8	5	5	5	10	15	10	15	11.35
	9	5	3	7	12	12	9	10	11.35

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Odysseyware	1	1	3	5	10	10	8	11	6.21
	2	5	3	10	12	2	7	13	6.21
	3	4	5	7	13	13	8	11	6.21
	4	1	4	9	12	7	7	10	6.21
	5	5	5	5	10	6	8	8	6.21
	6	0	5	8	12	7	7	10	6.21
	7	2	5	5	5	5	3	7	6.21
	8	5	5	5	5	15	7	15	6.21
	9	1	4	7	5	5	5	7	6.21

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
CompassLearning, Inc.	1	5	5	10	0	11	7	12	25
	2	5	4	10	0	8	8	13	25
	3	4	5	9	0	15	10	13	25
	4	2	4	9	0	8	7	12	25
	5	2	4	2	0	6	4	6	25
	6	4	3	8	0	5	10	12	25
	7	4	3	8	0	8	5	7	25
	8	5	5	5	0	15	7	15	25
	9	3	4	3	0	5	5	5	25

Cumulative Score Sheet  
RFP 893  
Online Credited Courses  
Proposal Due Date: June 24, 2015

**Core Academic Courses without Remote Teacher**

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Edgenuity, Inc.	1	5	5	10	15	15	10	13	3.88
	2	5	5	10	15	15	10	15	3.88
	3	4	4	9	13	14	8	12	3.88
	4	5	4	10	13	15	9	13	3.88
	5	5	5	10	15	14	10	15	3.88
	6	5	5	10	15	7	10	12	3.88
	7	5	2	8	8	8	5	0	3.88
	8	5	5	5	12	15	10	15	3.88
	9	5	4	7	10	12	7	7	3.88

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Fuel Education, LLC	1	5	4	9	13	15	10	14	1.74
	2	5	5	10	15	10	10	15	1.74
	3	4	4	9	14	13	10	10	1.74
	4	5	5	10	13	15	8	15	1.74
	5	5	5	10	10	10	8	10	1.74
	6	5	5	10	10	10	5	12	1.74
	7	3	4	6	5	5	3	7	1.74
	8	5	5	5	11	15	10	15	1.74
	9	5	4	7	5	12	8	10	1.74

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
NCS Pearson, Inc.	1	5	3	9	12	15	10	13	10.15
	2	5	4	10	14	7	9	14	10.15
	3	5	4	8	13	14	10	12	10.15
	4	5	4	10	13	14	8	13	10.15
	5	5	5	10	10	8	8	10	10.15
	6	5	3	8	10	8	5	8	10.15
	7	5	4	8	12	10	5	7	10.15
	8	5	5	5	10	15	10	15	10.15
	9	5	3	7	12	12	9	10	10.15

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Odysseyware	1	1	3	5	10	10	8	11	3.44
	2	5	3	10	12	2	7	13	3.44
	3	4	5	7	13	13	8	11	3.44
	4	1	4	9	12	7	7	10	3.44
	5	5	5	5	10	6	8	8	3.44
	6	0	5	8	12	7	7	10	3.44
	7	2	5	5	5	5	3	7	3.44
	8	5	5	5	5	15	7	15	3.44
	9	1	4	7	5	5	5	7	3.44

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
CompassLearning, Inc.	1	5	5	10	0	11	7	12	25
	2	5	4	10	0	8	8	13	25
	3	4	5	9	0	15	10	13	25
	4	2	4	9	0	8	7	12	25
	5	2	4	2	0	6	4	6	25
	6	4	3	8	0	5	10	12	25
	7	4	3	8	0	8	5	7	25
	8	5	5	5	0	15	7	15	25
	9	3	4	3	0	5	5	5	25

Cumulative Score Sheet  
RFP 893  
Online Credited Courses  
Proposal Due Date: June 24, 2015

**Credit Recovery without Remote Teacher**

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Edgenuity, Inc.	1	5	5	10	15	15	10	13	3.88
	2	5	5	10	15	15	10	15	3.88
	3	4	4	9	13	14	8	12	3.88
	4	5	4	10	13	15	9	13	3.88
	5	5	5	10	15	14	10	15	3.88
	6	5	5	10	15	7	10	12	3.88
	7	5	2	8	8	8	5	0	3.88
	8	5	5	5	12	15	10	15	3.88
	9	5	4	7	10	12	7	7	3.88

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Fuel Education, LLC	1	5	4	9	13	15	10	14	1.96
	2	5	5	10	15	10	10	15	1.96
	3	4	4	9	14	13	10	10	1.96
	4	5	5	10	13	15	8	15	1.96
	5	5	5	10	10	10	8	10	1.96
	6	5	5	10	10	10	5	12	1.96
	7	3	4	6	5	5	3	7	1.96
	8	5	5	5	11	15	10	15	1.96
	9	5	4	7	5	12	8	10	1.96

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
NCS Pearson, Inc.	1	5	3	9	12	15	10	13	10.15
	2	5	4	10	14	7	9	14	10.15
	3	5	4	8	13	14	10	12	10.15
	4	5	4	10	13	14	8	13	10.15
	5	5	5	10	10	8	8	10	10.15
	6	5	3	8	10	8	5	8	10.15
	7	5	4	8	12	10	5	7	10.15
	8	5	5	5	10	15	10	15	10.15
	9	5	3	7	12	12	9	10	10.15

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Odysseyware	1	1	3	5	10	10	8	11	3.44
	2	5	3	10	12	2	7	13	3.44
	3	4	5	7	13	13	8	11	3.44
	4	1	4	9	12	7	7	10	3.44
	5	5	5	5	10	6	8	8	3.44
	6	0	5	8	12	7	7	10	3.44
	7	2	5	5	5	5	3	7	3.44
	8	5	5	5	5	15	7	15	3.44
	9	1	4	7	5	5	5	7	3.44

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
CompassLearning, Inc.	1	5	5	10	0	11	7	12	25
	2	5	4	10	0	8	8	13	25
	3	4	5	9	0	15	10	13	25
	4	2	4	9	0	8	7	12	25
	5	2	4	2	0	6	4	6	25
	6	4	3	8	0	5	10	12	25
	7	4	3	8	0	8	5	7	25
	8	5	5	5	0	15	7	15	25
	9	3	4	3	0	5	5	5	25

Cumulative Score Sheet  
RFP 893  
Online Credited Courses  
Proposal Due Date: June 24, 2015

**Electives with Remote Teacher**

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Edgenuity, Inc.	1	5	5	10	15	15	10	13	25
	2	5	5	10	15	15	10	15	25
	3	4	4	9	13	14	8	12	25
	4	5	4	10	13	15	9	13	25
	5	5	5	10	15	14	10	15	25
	6	5	5	10	15	7	10	12	25
	7	5	2	8	8	8	5	0	25
	8	5	5	5	12	15	10	15	25
	9	5	4	7	10	12	7	7	25

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Fuel Education, LLC	1	5	4	9	13	15	10	14	21.31
	2	5	5	10	15	10	10	15	21.31
	3	4	4	9	14	13	10	10	21.31
	4	5	5	10	13	15	8	15	21.31
	5	5	5	10	10	10	8	10	21.31
	6	5	5	10	10	10	5	12	21.31
	7	3	4	6	5	5	3	7	21.31
	8	5	5	5	11	15	10	15	21.31
	9	5	4	7	5	12	8	10	21.31

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
NCS Pearson, Inc.	1	No Bid							
	2								
	3								
	4								
	5								
	6								
	7								
	8								
	9								

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Odysseyware	1	1	3	5	10	10	8	11	22.5
	2	5	3	10	12	2	7	13	22.5
	3	4	5	7	13	13	8	11	22.5
	4	1	4	9	12	7	7	10	22.5
	5	5	5	5	10	6	8	8	22.5
	6	0	5	8	12	7	7	10	22.5
	7	2	5	5	5	5	3	7	22.5
	8	5	5	5	5	15	7	15	22.5
	9	1	4	7	5	5	5	7	22.5

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
CompassLearning, Inc.	1	No Bid							
	2								
	3								
	4								
	5								
	6								
	7								
	8								
	9								

Cumulative Score Sheet  
RFP 893  
Online Credited Courses  
Proposal Due Date: June 24, 2015

**English as a Second Language without Remote Teacher**

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Edgenuity, Inc.	1								
	2								
	3								
	4								
	5								
	6								
	7								
	8								
	9								

No Bid

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Fuel Education, LLC	1	5	4	9	13	15	10	14	25
	2	5	5	10	15	10	10	15	25
	3	4	4	9	14	13	10	10	25
	4	5	5	10	13	15	8	15	25
	5	5	5	10	10	10	8	10	25
	6	5	5	10	10	10	5	12	25
	7	3	4	6	5	5	3	7	25
	8	5	5	5	11	15	10	15	25
	9	5	4	7	5	12	8	10	25

765.00

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
NCS Pearson, Inc.	1								
	2								
	3								
	4								
	5								
	6								
	7								
	8								
	9								

No Bid

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Odysseyware	1								
	2								
	3								
	4								
	5								
	6								
	7								
	8								
	9								

No Bid

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
CompassLearning, Inc.	1								
	2								
	3								
	4								
	5								
	6								
	7								
	8								
	9								

No Bid

Cumulative Score Sheet  
RFP 893  
Online Credited Courses  
Proposal Due Date: June 24, 2015

**GED without Remote Teacher**

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Edgenuity, Inc.	1	5	5	10	15	15	10	13	3.88
	2	5	5	10	15	15	10	15	3.88
	3	4	4	9	13	14	8	12	3.88
	4	5	4	10	13	15	9	13	3.88
	5	5	5	10	15	14	10	15	3.88
	6	5	5	10	15	7	10	12	3.88
	7	5	2	8	8	8	5	0	3.88
	8	5	5	5	12	15	10	15	3.88
	9	5	4	7	10	12	7	7	3.88

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Fuel Education, LLC	1	5	4	9	13	15	10	14	2.07
	2	5	5	10	15	10	10	15	2.07
	3	4	4	9	14	13	10	10	2.07
	4	5	5	10	13	15	8	15	2.07
	5	5	5	10	10	10	8	10	2.07
	6	5	5	10	10	10	5	12	2.07
	7	3	4	6	5	5	3	7	2.07
	8	5	5	5	11	15	10	15	2.07
	9	5	4	7	5	12	8	10	2.07

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
NCS Pearson, Inc.	1	5	3	9	12	15	10	13	25
	2	5	4	10	14	7	9	14	25
	3	5	4	8	13	14	10	12	25
	4	5	4	10	13	14	8	13	25
	5	5	5	10	10	8	8	10	25
	6	5	3	8	10	8	5	8	25
	7	5	4	8	12	10	5	7	25
	8	5	5	5	10	15	10	15	25
	9	5	3	7	12	12	9	10	25

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Odysseyware	1	1	3	5	10	10	8	11	2.93
	2	5	3	10	12	2	7	13	2.93
	3	4	5	7	13	13	8	11	2.93
	4	1	4	9	12	7	7	10	2.93
	5	5	5	5	10	6	8	8	2.93
	6	0	5	8	12	7	7	10	2.93
	7	2	5	5	5	5	3	7	2.93
	8	5	5	5	5	15	7	15	2.93
	9	1	4	7	5	5	5	7	2.93

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
CompassLearning, Inc.	1	5	5	10	0	11	7	12	21.25
	2	5	4	10	0	8	8	13	21.25
	3	4	5	9	0	15	10	13	21.25
	4	2	4	9	0	8	7	12	21.25
	5	2	4	2	0	6	4	6	21.25
	6	4	3	8	0	5	10	12	21.25
	7	4	3	8	0	8	5	7	21.25
	8	5	5	5	0	15	7	15	21.25
	9	3	4	3	0	5	5	5	21.25

Cumulative Score Sheet  
RFP 893  
Online Credited Courses  
Proposal Due Date: June 24, 2015

**World Languages without Remote Teacher**

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Edgenuity, Inc.	1	5	5	10	15	15	10	13	8.93
	2	5	5	10	15	15	10	15	8.93
	3	4	4	9	13	14	8	12	8.93
	4	5	4	10	13	15	9	13	8.93
	5	5	5	10	15	14	10	15	8.93
	6	5	5	10	15	7	10	12	8.93
	7	5	2	8	8	8	5	0	8.93
	8	5	5	5	12	15	10	15	8.93
	9	5	4	7	10	12	7	7	8.93

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Fuel Education, LLC	1	5	4	9	13	15	10	14	4.01
	2	5	5	10	15	10	10	15	4.01
	3	4	4	9	14	13	10	10	4.01
	4	5	5	10	13	15	8	15	4.01
	5	5	5	10	10	10	8	10	4.01
	6	5	5	10	10	10	5	12	4.01
	7	3	4	6	5	5	3	7	4.01
	8	5	5	5	11	15	10	15	4.01
	9	5	4	7	5	12	8	10	4.01

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
NCS Pearson, Inc.	1	5	3	9	12	15	10	13	12.21
	2	5	4	10	14	7	9	14	12.21
	3	5	4	8	13	14	10	12	12.21
	4	5	4	10	13	14	8	13	12.21
	5	5	5	10	10	8	8	10	12.21
	6	5	3	8	10	8	5	8	12.21
	7	5	4	8	12	10	5	7	12.21
	8	5	5	5	10	15	10	15	12.21
	9	5	3	7	12	12	9	10	12.21

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Odysseyware	1	1	3	5	10	10	8	11	7.94
	2	5	3	10	12	2	7	13	7.94
	3	4	5	7	13	13	8	11	7.94
	4	1	4	9	12	7	7	10	7.94
	5	5	5	5	10	6	8	8	7.94
	6	0	5	8	12	7	7	10	7.94
	7	2	5	5	5	5	3	7	7.94
	8	5	5	5	5	15	7	15	7.94
	9	1	4	7	5	5	5	7	7.94

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
CompassLearning, Inc.	1	5	5	10	0	11	7	12	25
	2	5	4	10	0	8	8	13	25
	3	4	5	9	0	15	10	13	25
	4	2	4	9	0	8	7	12	25
	5	2	4	2	0	6	4	6	25
	6	4	3	8	0	5	10	12	25
	7	4	3	8	0	8	5	7	25
	8	5	5	5	0	15	7	15	25
	9	3	4	3	0	5	5	5	25



Cumulative Score Sheet  
RFP 893  
Online Credited Courses  
Proposal Due Date: June 24, 2015

**Advanced Placement with Remote Teacher**

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Edgenuity, Inc.	1	5	5	10	15	15	10	13	25
	2	5	5	10	15	15	10	15	25
	3	4	4	9	13	14	8	12	25
	4	5	4	10	13	15	9	13	25
	5	5	5	10	15	14	10	15	25
	6	5	5	10	15	7	10	12	25
	7	5	2	8	8	8	5	0	25
	8	5	5	5	12	15	10	15	25
	9	5	4	7	10	12	7	7	25

799.00

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Fuel Education, LLC	1	5	4	9	13	15	10	14	19.13
	2	5	5	10	15	10	10	15	19.13
	3	4	4	9	14	13	10	10	19.13
	4	5	5	10	13	15	8	15	19.13
	5	5	5	10	10	10	8	10	19.13
	6	5	5	10	10	10	5	12	19.13
	7	3	4	6	5	5	3	7	19.13
	8	5	5	5	11	15	10	15	19.13
	9	5	4	7	5	12	8	10	19.13

712.17

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
NCS Pearson, Inc.	1	No Bid							
	2								
	3								
	4								
	5								
	6								
	7								
	8								
	9								

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Odysseyware	1	No Bid							
	2								
	3								
	4								
	5								
	6								
	7								
	8								
	9								

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
CompassLearning, Inc.	1	No Bid							
	2								
	3								
	4								
	5								
	6								
	7								
	8								
	9								

Cumulative Score Sheet  
RFP 893  
Online Credited Courses  
Proposal Due Date: June 24, 2015

**Core Academic Courses with Remote Teacher**

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Edgenuity, Inc.	1	5	5	10	15	15	10	13	25
	2	5	5	10	15	15	10	15	25
	3	4	4	9	13	14	8	12	25
	4	5	4	10	13	15	9	13	25
	5	5	5	10	15	14	10	15	25
	6	5	5	10	15	7	10	12	25
	7	5	2	8	8	8	5	0	25
	8	5	5	5	12	15	10	15	25
	9	5	4	7	10	12	7	7	25

799.00

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Fuel Education, LLC	1	5	4	9	13	15	10	14	21.31
	2	5	5	10	15	10	10	15	21.31
	3	4	4	9	14	13	10	10	21.31
	4	5	5	10	13	15	8	15	21.31
	5	5	5	10	10	10	8	10	21.31
	6	5	5	10	10	10	5	12	21.31
	7	3	4	6	5	5	3	7	21.31
	8	5	5	5	11	15	10	15	21.31
	9	5	4	7	5	12	8	10	21.31

731.79

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
NCS Pearson, Inc.	1	No Bid							
	2								
	3								
	4								
	5								
	6								
	7								
	8								
	9								

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Odysseyware	1	1	3	5	10	10	8	11	22.5
	2	5	3	10	12	2	7	13	22.5
	3	4	5	7	13	13	8	11	22.5
	4	1	4	9	12	7	7	10	22.5
	5	5	5	5	10	6	8	8	22.5
	6	0	5	8	12	7	7	10	22.5
	7	2	5	5	5	5	3	7	22.5
	8	5	5	5	5	15	7	15	22.5
	9	1	4	7	5	5	5	7	22.5

632.50

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
CompassLearning, Inc.	1	No Bid							
	2								
	3								
	4								
	5								
	6								
	7								
	8								
	9								

Cumulative Score Sheet  
RFP 893  
Online Credited Courses  
Proposal Due Date: June 24, 2015

**Credit Recovery with Remote Teacher**

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Edgenuity, Inc.	1	5	5	10	15	15	10	13	25
	2	5	5	10	15	15	10	15	25
	3	4	4	9	13	14	8	12	25
	4	5	4	10	13	15	9	13	25
	5	5	5	10	15	14	10	15	25
	6	5	5	10	15	7	10	12	25
	7	5	2	8	8	8	5	0	25
	8	5	5	5	12	15	10	15	25
	9	5	4	7	10	12	7	7	25

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Fuel Education, LLC	1	5	4	9	13	15	10	14	22.15
	2	5	5	10	15	10	10	15	22.15
	3	4	4	9	14	13	10	10	22.15
	4	5	5	10	13	15	8	15	22.15
	5	5	5	10	10	10	8	10	22.15
	6	5	5	10	10	10	5	12	22.15
	7	3	4	6	5	5	3	7	22.15
	8	5	5	5	11	15	10	15	22.15
	9	5	4	7	5	12	8	10	22.15

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
NCS Pearson, Inc.	1	No Bid							
	2								
	3								
	4								
	5								
	6								
	7								
	8								
	9								

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Odysseyware	1	1	3	5	10	10	8	11	22.5
	2	5	3	10	12	2	7	13	22.5
	3	4	5	7	13	13	8	11	22.5
	4	1	4	9	12	7	7	10	22.5
	5	5	5	5	10	6	8	8	22.5
	6	0	5	8	12	7	7	10	22.5
	7	2	5	5	5	5	3	7	22.5
	8	5	5	5	5	15	7	15	22.5
	9	1	4	7	5	5	5	7	22.5

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
CompassLearning, Inc.	1	No Bid							
	2								
	3								
	4								
	5								
	6								
	7								
	8								
	9								

Cumulative Score Sheet  
RFP 893  
Online Credited Courses  
Proposal Due Date: June 24, 2015

**Electives with Remote Teacher**

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Edgenuity, Inc.	1	5	5	10	15	15	10	13	25
	2	5	5	10	15	15	10	15	25
	3	4	4	9	13	14	8	12	25
	4	5	4	10	13	15	9	13	25
	5	5	5	10	15	14	10	15	25
	6	5	5	10	15	7	10	12	25
	7	5	2	8	8	8	5	0	25
	8	5	5	5	12	15	10	15	25
	9	5	4	7	10	12	7	7	25

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Fuel Education, LLC	1	5	4	9	13	15	10	14	21.31
	2	5	5	10	15	10	10	15	21.31
	3	4	4	9	14	13	10	10	21.31
	4	5	5	10	13	15	8	15	21.31
	5	5	5	10	10	10	8	10	21.31
	6	5	5	10	10	10	5	12	21.31
	7	3	4	6	5	5	3	7	21.31
	8	5	5	5	11	15	10	15	21.31
	9	5	4	7	5	12	8	10	21.31

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
NCS Pearson, Inc.	1	No Bid							
	2								
	3								
	4								
	5								
	6								
	7								
	8								
	9								

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Odysseyware	1	1	3	5	10	10	8	11	22.5
	2	5	3	10	12	2	7	13	22.5
	3	4	5	7	13	13	8	11	22.5
	4	1	4	9	12	7	7	10	22.5
	5	5	5	5	10	6	8	8	22.5
	6	0	5	8	12	7	7	10	22.5
	7	2	5	5	5	5	3	7	22.5
	8	5	5	5	5	15	7	15	22.5
	9	1	4	7	5	5	5	7	22.5

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
CompassLearning, Inc.	1	No Bid							
	2								
	3								
	4								
	5								
	6								
	7								
	8								
	9								

Cumulative Score Sheet  
RFP 893  
Online Credited Courses  
Proposal Due Date: June 24, 2015

**English as a Second Language with Remote Teacher**

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Edgenuity, Inc.	1	No Bid							
	2								
	3								
	4								
	5								
	6								
	7								
	8								
	9								

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Fuel Education, LLC	1	No Bid							
	2								
	3								
	4								
	5								
	6								
	7								
	8								
	9								

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
NCS Pearson, Inc.	1	No Bid							
	2								
	3								
	4								
	5								
	6								
	7								
	8								
	9								

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Odysseyware	1	No Bid							
	2								
	3								
	4								
	5								
	6								
	7								
	8								
	9								

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
CompassLearning, Inc.	1	No Bid							
	2								
	3								
	4								
	5								
	6								
	7								
	8								
	9								

Cumulative Score Sheet  
RFP 893  
Online Credited Courses  
Proposal Due Date: June 24, 2015

**GED with Remote Teacher**

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Edgenuty, Inc.	1	5	5	10	15	15	10	13	25
	2	5	5	10	15	15	10	15	25
	3	4	4	9	13	14	8	12	25
	4	5	4	10	13	15	9	13	25
	5	5	5	10	15	14	10	15	25
	6	5	5	10	15	7	10	12	25
	7	5	2	8	8	8	5	0	25
	8	5	5	5	12	15	10	15	25
	9	5	4	7	10	12	7	7	25
<b>799.00</b>									

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Fuel Education, LLC	1	No Bid							
	2								
	3								
	4								
	5								
	6								
	7								
	8								
	9								

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
NCS Pearson, Inc.	1	No Bid							
	2								
	3								
	4								
	5								
	6								
	7								
	8								
	9								

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Odysseyware	1	1	3	5	10	8	11	22.5	
	2	5	3	10	12	2	7	13	22.5
	3	4	5	7	13	13	8	11	22.5
	4	1	4	9	12	7	7	10	22.5
	5	5	5	5	10	6	8	8	22.5
	6	0	5	8	12	7	7	10	22.5
	7	2	5	5	5	5	3	7	22.5
	8	5	5	5	5	15	7	15	22.5
	9	1	4	7	5	5	5	7	22.5
<b>632.50</b>									

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
CompassLearning, Inc.	1	No Bid							
	2								
	3								
	4								
	5								
	6								
	7								
	8								
	9								

Cumulative Score Sheet  
RFP 893  
Online Credited Courses  
Proposal Due Date: June 24, 2015

**World Languages with Remote Teacher**

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Edgenuity, Inc.	1	5	5	10	15	15	10	13	25
	2	5	5	10	15	15	10	15	25
	3	4	4	9	13	14	8	12	25
	4	5	4	10	13	15	9	13	25
	5	5	5	10	15	14	10	15	25
	6	5	5	10	15	7	10	12	25
	7	5	2	8	8	8	5	0	25
	8	5	5	5	12	15	10	15	25
	9	5	4	7	10	12	7	7	25
<b>799.00</b>									

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Fuel Education, LLC	1	5	4	9	13	15	10	14	21.31
	2	5	5	10	15	10	10	15	21.31
	3	4	4	9	14	13	10	10	21.31
	4	5	5	10	13	15	8	15	21.31
	5	5	5	10	10	10	8	10	21.31
	6	5	5	10	10	10	5	12	21.31
	7	3	4	6	5	5	3	7	21.31
	8	5	5	5	11	15	10	15	21.31
	9	5	4	7	5	12	8	10	21.31
<b>731.79</b>									

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
NCS Pearson, Inc.	1								<b>No Bid</b>
	2								
	3								
	4								
	5								
	6								
	7								
	8								
	9								

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
Odysseyware	1	1	3	5	10	10	8	11	22.5
	2	5	3	10	12	2	7	13	22.5
	3	4	5	7	13	13	8	11	22.5
	4	1	4	9	12	7	7	10	22.5
	5	5	5	5	10	6	8	8	22.5
	6	0	5	8	12	7	7	10	22.5
	7	2	5	5	5	5	3	7	22.5
	8	5	5	5	5	15	7	15	22.5
	9	1	4	7	5	5	5	7	22.5
<b>632.50</b>									

	Proof of Proposer's Financial Stability (Max: 5 Points)	Satisfaction of Past Customers (Max: 5 Points)	Relevant Work Experience (Max: 10 Points)	System Design (Max: 15 Points)	Quality and Comprehensiveness of Course Offerings (Max: 15 Points)	Professional Development / Customer Support (Max: 10 Points)	Evidence of Efficacy (Max: 15 Points)	Pricing of Proposed Services (Max: 25 Points)	Total Combined Score
CompassLearning, Inc.	1								<b>No Bid</b>
	2								
	3								
	4								
	5								
	6								
	7								
	8								
	9								