

FINAL TABULATION SCORE SHEET
RFP 892
Library Books and Library Materials
PROPOSAL DUE DATE: 7/14/2015

Item: ACD

	Bakey & Taylor					Mackin Educational Resources					Follett School Solutions				
Background and Financial Stability	0.0					48.0					47.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	8.0	10.0	10.0	8.0	9.0	10.0
Experience with Like Projects	0.0					71.0					75.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						13.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	13.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	15.0
Quality of Proposed Solutions/ Availability of Library Books/Materials	0.0					109.0					110.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						25.0	25.0	22.0	15.0	22.0	23.0	25.0	25.0	15.0	22.0
Cost	0.0					200.0					193.9				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						40.0	40.0	40.0	40.0	40.0	38.8	38.8	38.8	38.8	38.8
Ability to Meet Vendor Requirements	0.0					50.0					49.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	9.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0
References	Pass					Pass					Pass				
Notes	NO BID ON THIS ITEM														
Total Points	0.0					478.0					474.9				

The number assigned to the evaluator is listed above their score. Cost points are calculated by Procurement with maximum points assigned to the lowest cost and a weighted assignment to the rest.

Awarded Vendor(s) Mackin Educational Resources
Follett School Solutions

Perma Bound Failed due to CCS

FINAL TABULATION SCORE SHEET
RFP 892
Library Books and Library Materials
PROPOSAL DUE DATE: 7/14/2015

Item: AIO

	Bakey & Taylor					Mackin Educational Resources					Follett School Solutions				
Background and Financial Stability	0.0					48.0					47.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	8.0	10.0	10.0	8.0	9.0	10.0
Experience with Like Projects	0.0					71.0					75.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						13.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	13.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	15.0
Quality of Proposed Solutions/ Availability of Library Books/Materials	0.0					109.0					110.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						25.0	25.0	22.0	15.0	22.0	23.0	25.0	25.0	15.0	22.0
Cost	0.0					200.0					193.9				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						40.0	40.0	40.0	40.0	40.0	38.8	38.8	38.8	38.8	38.8
Ability to Meet Vendor Requirements	0.0					50.0					49.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	9.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0
References	Pass					Pass					Pass				
Notes	NO BID ON THIS ITEM														
Total Points	0.0					478.0					474.9				

The number assigned to the evaluator is listed above their score. Cost points are calculated by Procurement with maximum points assigned to the lowest cost and a weighted assignment to the rest.

Awarded Vendor(s) Mackin Educational Resources
Follett School Solutions

Perma Bound Failed due to CCS

FINAL TABULATION SCORE SHEET
RFP 892
Library Books and Library Materials
PROPOSAL DUE DATE: 7/14/2015

Item: BIGBK

	Bakey & Taylor					Mackin Educational Resources					Follett School Solutions				
Background and Financial Stability	0.0					48.0					47.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	8.0	10.0	10.0	8.0	9.0	10.0
Experience with Like Projects	0.0					71.0					75.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						13.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	13.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	15.0
Quality of Proposed Solutions/ Availability of Library Books/Materials	0.0					109.0					110.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						25.0	25.0	22.0	15.0	22.0	23.0	25.0	25.0	15.0	22.0
Cost	0.0					200.0					179.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5

						40.0	40.0	40.0	40.0	40.0	35.79	35.79	35.79	35.79	35.79
Ability to Meet Vendor Requirements	0.0					50.0					49.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	9.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0
References	Pass					Pass					Pass				
Notes	NO BID ON THIS ITEM														
Total Points	0.0					478.0					460.0				

The number assigned to the evaluator is listed above their score. Cost points are calculated by Procurement with maximum points assigned to the lowest cost and a weighted assignment to the rest.

Awarded Vendor(s) Mackin Educational Resources
Follett School Solutions

Perma Bound Failed due to CCS

FINAL TABULATION SCORE SHEET
RFP 892
Library Books and Library Materials
PROPOSAL DUE DATE: 7/14/2015

Item: BOARD

	Bakey & Taylor					Mackin Educational Resources					Follett School Solutions				
Background and Financial Stability	0.0					48.0					47.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	8.0	10.0	10.0	8.0	9.0	10.0
Experience with Like Projects	0.0					71.0					75.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						13.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	13.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	15.0
Quality of Proposed Solutions/ Availability of Library Books/Materials	0.0					109.0					110.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						25.0	25.0	22.0	15.0	22.0	23.0	25.0	25.0	15.0	22.0
Cost	0.0					200.0					197.7				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						40.0	40.0	40.0	40.0	40.0	39.53	39.53	39.53	39.53	39.53
Ability to Meet Vendor Requirements	0.0					50.0					49.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	9.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0
References	Pass					Pass					Pass				
Notes	NO BID ON THIS ITEM														
Total Points	0.0					478.0					478.7				

The number assigned to the evaluator is listed above their score. Cost points are calculated by Procurement with maximum points assigned to the lowest cost and a weighted assignment to the rest.

Awarded Vendor(s) Mackin Educational Resources
Follett School Solutions

Perma Bound Failed due to CCS

FINAL TABULATION SCORE SHEET
RFP 892
Library Books and Library Materials
PROPOSAL DUE DATE: 7/14/2015

Item: DVD

	Bakey & Taylor					Mackin Educational Resources					Follett School Solutions				
Background and Financial Stability	0.0					48.0					47.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	8.0	10.0	10.0	8.0	9.0	10.0
Experience with Like Projects	0.0					71.0					75.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						13.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	13.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	15.0
Quality of Proposed Solutions/ Availability of Library Books/Materials	0.0					109.0					110.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						25.0	25.0	22.0	15.0	22.0	23.0	25.0	25.0	15.0	22.0
Cost	0.0					200.0					198.8				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						40.0	40.0	40.0	40.0	40.0	39.76	39.76	39.76	39.76	39.76
Ability to Meet Vendor Requirements	0.0					50.0					49.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	9.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0
References	Pass					Pass					Pass				
Notes	NO BID ON THIS ITEM														
Total Points	0.0					478.0					479.8				

The number assigned to the evaluator is listed above their score. Cost points are calculated by Procurement with maximum points assigned to the lowest cost and a weighted assignment to the rest.

Awarded Vendor(s) Mackin Educational Resources
Follett School Solutions

Perma Bound Failed due to CCS

FINAL TABULATION SCORE SHEET
RFP 892
Library Books and Library Materials
PROPOSAL DUE DATE: 7/14/2015

Item: L/R

	Bakey & Taylor					Mackin Educational Resources					Follett School Solutions				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
Background and Financial Stability	39.0					48.0					47.0				
	10.0	6.0	10.0	7.0	6.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	8.0	10.0	10.0	8.0	9.0	10.0
Experience with Like Projects	60.0					71.0					75.0				
	10.0	10.0	13.0	12.0	15.0	13.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	13.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	15.0
Quality of Proposed Solutions/ Availability of Library Books/Materials	90.0					109.0					110.0				
	18.0	8.0	21.0	20.0	23.0	25.0	25.0	22.0	15.0	22.0	23.0	25.0	25.0	15.0	22.0
Cost	200.0					180.7					169.7				
	40.0	40.0	40.0	40.0	40.0	36.1	36.1	36.1	36.1	36.1	33.94	33.94	33.94	33.94	33.94
Ability to Meet Vendor Requirements	28.0					50.0					49.0				
	5.0	5.0	6.0	5.0	7.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	9.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0
References	Pass					Pass					Pass				
Notes	NO BID ON THIS ITEM														
Total Points	417.0					458.7					450.7				

The number assigned to the evaluator is listed above their score. Cost points are calculated by Procurement with maximum points assigned to the lowest cost and a weighted assignment to the rest.

Awarded Vendor(s) Mackin Educational Resources
Follett School Solutions

Perma Bound Failed due to CCS

FINAL TABULATION SCORE SHEET
RFP 892
Library Books and Library Materials
PROPOSAL DUE DATE: 7/14/2015

Item: MP3-CD

	Bakey & Taylor					Mackin Educational Resources					Follett School Solutions				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
Background and Financial Stability	0.0					48.0					47.0				
	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	8.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	8.0	10.0	10.0	8.0	9.0	10.0
Experience with Like Projects	0.0					71.0					75.0				
	13.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	13.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	13.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	15.0
Quality of Proposed Solutions/ Availability of Library Books/Materials	0.0					109.0					110.0				
	25.0	25.0	22.0	15.0	22.0	23.0	25.0	25.0	15.0	22.0	23.0	25.0	25.0	15.0	22.0
Cost	0.0					200.0					193.9				
	40.0	40.0	40.0	40.0	40.0	38.78	38.78	38.78	38.78	38.78	38.78	38.78	38.78	38.78	38.78
Ability to Meet Vendor Requirements	0.0					50.0					49.0				
	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	9.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	9.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0
References	Pass					Pass					Pass				
Notes	NO BID ON THIS ITEM														
Total Points	0.0					478.0					474.9				

The number assigned to the evaluator is listed above their score. Cost points are calculated by Procurement with maximum points assigned to the lowest cost and a weighted assignment to the rest.

Awarded Vendor(s) Mackin Educational Resources
Follett School Solutions

Perma Bound Failed due to CCS

FINAL TABULATION SCORE SHEET
RFP 892
Library Books and Library Materials
PROPOSAL DUE DATE: 7/14/2015

Item: Music CD

	Bakey & Taylor					Mackin Educational Resources					Follett School Solutions				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
Background and Financial Stability	0.0					48.0					47.0				
	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	8.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	8.0	10.0	10.0	8.0	9.0	10.0
Experience with Like Projects	0.0					71.0					75.0				
	13.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	13.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	13.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	15.0
Quality of Proposed Solutions/ Availability of Library Books/Materials	0.0					109.0					110.0				
	25.0	25.0	22.0	15.0	22.0	23.0	25.0	25.0	15.0	22.0	23.0	25.0	25.0	15.0	22.0
Cost	0.0					200.0					195.5				

Cost	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						40.0	40.0	40.0	40.0	40.0	39.1	39.1	39.1	39.1	39.1
Ability to Meet Vendor Requirements	0.0					50.0					49.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	9.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0
References	Pass					Pass					Pass				
Notes	NO BID ON THIS ITEM														
Total Points	0.0					478.0					476.5				

The number assigned to the evaluator is listed above their score. Cost points are calculated by Procurement with maximum points assigned to the lowest cost and a weighted assignment to the rest.

Awarded Vendor(s) Mackin Educational Resources
Follett School Solutions

Perma Bound Failed due to CCS

FINAL TABULATION SCORE SHEET
RFP 892
Library Books and Library Materials
PROPOSAL DUE DATE: 7/14/2015

Item: PB

	Bakey & Taylor					Mackin Educational Resources					Follett School Solutions				
Background and Financial Stability	39.0					48.0					47.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
	10.0	6.0	10.0	7.0	6.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	8.0	10.0	10.0	8.0	9.0	10.0
Experience with Like Projects	60.0					71.0					75.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
	10.0	10.0	13.0	12.0	15.0	13.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	13.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	15.0
Quality of Proposed Solutions/ Availability of Library Books/Materials	90.0					109.0					110.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
	18.0	8.0	21.0	20.0	23.0	25.0	25.0	22.0	15.0	22.0	23.0	25.0	25.0	15.0	22.0
Cost	200.0					198.8					172.5				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
	40.0	40.0	40.0	40.0	40.0	39.75	39.75	39.75	39.75	39.75	34.49	34.49	34.49	34.49	34.49
Ability to Meet Vendor Requirements	28.0					50.0					49.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
	5.0	5.0	6.0	5.0	7.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	9.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0
References	Pass					Pass					Pass				
Notes	NO BID ON THIS ITEM														
Total Points	417.0					476.8					453.5				

The number assigned to the evaluator is listed above their score. Cost points are calculated by Procurement with maximum points assigned to the lowest cost and a weighted assignment to the rest.

Awarded Vendor(s) Mackin Educational Resources
Follett School Solutions

Perma Bound Failed due to CCS

FINAL TABULATION SCORE SHEET
RFP 892
Library Books and Library Materials
PROPOSAL DUE DATE: 7/14/2015

Item: PBK

	Bakey & Taylor					Mackin Educational Resources					Follett School Solutions				
Background and Financial Stability	39.0					48.0					47.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
	10.0	6.0	10.0	7.0	6.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	8.0	10.0	10.0	8.0	9.0	10.0
Experience with Like Projects	60.0					71.0					75.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
	10.0	10.0	13.0	12.0	15.0	13.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	13.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	15.0
Quality of Proposed Solutions/ Availability of Library Books/Materials	90.0					109.0					110.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
	18.0	8.0	21.0	20.0	23.0	25.0	25.0	22.0	15.0	22.0	23.0	25.0	25.0	15.0	22.0
Cost	200.0					197.2					173.2				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
	40.0	40.0	40.0	40.0	40.0	39.43	39.43	39.43	39.43	39.43	34.64	34.64	34.64	34.64	34.64
Ability to Meet Vendor Requirements	28.0					50.0					49.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
	5.0	5.0	6.0	5.0	7.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	9.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0
References	Pass					Pass					Pass				
Notes	NO BID ON THIS ITEM														
Total Points	417.0					475.2					454.2				

The number assigned to the evaluator is listed above their score. Cost points are calculated by Procurement with maximum points assigned to the lowest cost and a weighted assignment to the rest.

Awarded Vendor(s) Mackin Educational Resources
Follett School Solutions

Perma Bound Failed due to CCS

FINAL TABULATION SCORE SHEET
RFP 892
Library Books and Library Materials
PROPOSAL DUE DATE: 7/14/2015

Item: Prof

	Bakey & Taylor					Mackin Educational Resources					Follett School Solutions				
Background and Financial Stability	0.0					48.0					47.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	8.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	8.0	10.0	10.0	8.0	9.0	10.0
Experience with Like Projects	0.0					71.0					75.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
	13.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	13.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	13.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	15.0
Quality of Proposed Solutions/ Availability of Library Books/Materials	0.0					109.0					110.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
	25.0	25.0	22.0	15.0	22.0	23.0	25.0	25.0	25.0	22.0	23.0	25.0	25.0	15.0	22.0
Cost	0.0					193.0					200.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
	38.59	38.59	38.59	38.59	38.59	40.0	40.0	40.0	40.0	40.0	40.0	40.0	40.0	40.0	40.0
Ability to Meet Vendor Requirements	0.0					50.0					49.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	9.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	9.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0
References	Pass					Pass					Pass				
Notes	NO BID ON THIS ITEM														
Total Points	0.0					471.0					481.0				

The number assigned to the evaluator is listed above their score. Cost points are calculated by Procurement with maximum points assigned to the lowest cost and a weighted assignment to the rest.

Awarded Vendor(s) Mackin Educational Resources
Follett School Solutions

Perma Bound Failed due to CCS

FINAL TABULATION SCORE SHEET
RFP 892
Library Books and Library Materials
PROPOSAL DUE DATE: 7/14/2015

Item: T-HC

	Bakey & Taylor					Mackin Educational Resources					Follett School Solutions				
Background and Financial Stability	39.0					48.0					47.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
	10.0	6.0	10.0	7.0	6.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	8.0	10.0	10.0	8.0	9.0	10.0
Experience with Like Projects	60.0					71.0					75.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
	10.0	10.0	13.0	12.0	15.0	13.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	13.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	15.0
Quality of Proposed Solutions/ Availability of Library Books/Materials	90.0					109.0					110.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
	18.0	8.0	21.0	20.0	23.0	25.0	25.0	22.0	15.0	22.0	23.0	25.0	25.0	15.0	22.0
Cost	200.0					186.6					163.9				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
	40.0	40.0	40.0	40.0	40.0	37.32	37.32	37.32	37.32	37.32	32.78	32.78	32.78	32.78	32.78
Ability to Meet Vendor Requirements	28.0					50.0					49.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
	5.0	5.0	6.0	5.0	7.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	9.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0
References	Pass					Pass					Pass				
Notes	NO BID ON THIS ITEM														
Total Points	417.0					464.6					444.9				

The number assigned to the evaluator is listed above their score. Cost points are calculated by Procurement with maximum points assigned to the lowest cost and a weighted assignment to the rest.

Awarded Vendor(s) Mackin Educational Resources
Follett School Solutions

Perma Bound Failed due to CCS

FINAL TABULATION SCORE SHEET
RFP 892
Library Books and Library Materials
PROPOSAL DUE DATE: 7/14/2015

Item: Spoken Words

	Bakey & Taylor					Mackin Educational Resources					Follett School Solutions				
Background and Financial Stability	0.0					48.0					47.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	8.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	8.0	10.0	10.0	8.0	9.0	10.0
Experience with Like Projects	0.0					71.0					75.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
	13.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	13.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	13.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	15.0
Quality of Proposed Solutions/ Availability of Library Books/Materials	0.0					109.0					110.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
	25.0	25.0	22.0	15.0	22.0	23.0	25.0	25.0	25.0	22.0	23.0	25.0	25.0	15.0	22.0
Cost	0.0					200.0					40.0				

Cost	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						40.00	40.00	40.00	40.00	40.00	8.0	8.0	8.0	8.0	8.0
Ability to Meet Vendor Requirements	0.0					50.0					49.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	9.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0
References	Pass					Pass					Pass				
Notes	NO BID ON THIS ITEM														
Total Points	0.0					478.0					321.0				

The number assigned to the evaluator is listed above their score. Cost points are calculated by Procurement with maximum points assigned to the lowest cost and a weighted assignment to the rest.

Awarded Vendor(s) Mackin Educational Resources
Follett School Solutions

Perma Bound Failed due to CCS

FINAL TABULATION SCORE SHEET
RFP 892
Library Books and Library Materials
PROPOSAL DUE DATE: 7/14/2015

Item: Interactive Books on CD

	Bakey & Taylor					Mackin Educational Resources					Follett School Solutions				
Background and Financial Stability	0.0					48.0					47.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	8.0	10.0	10.0	8.0	9.0	10.0
Experience with Like Projects	0.0					71.0					75.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						13.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	13.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	15.0
Quality of Proposed Solutions/ Availability of Library Books/Materials	0.0					109.0					110.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						25.0	25.0	22.0	15.0	22.0	23.0	25.0	25.0	15.0	22.0
Cost	0.0					200.0					40.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						40.00	40.00	40.00	40.00	40.00	8.0	8.0	8.0	8.0	8.0
Ability to Meet Vendor Requirements	0.0					50.0					49.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	9.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0
References	Pass					Pass					Pass				
Notes	NO BID ON THIS ITEM														
Total Points	0.0					478.0					321.0				

The number assigned to the evaluator is listed above their score. Cost points are calculated by Procurement with maximum points assigned to the lowest cost and a weighted assignment to the rest.

Awarded Vendor(s) Mackin Educational Resources
Follett School Solutions

Perma Bound Failed due to CCS

FINAL TABULATION SCORE SHEET
RFP 892
Library Books and Library Materials
PROPOSAL DUE DATE: 7/14/2015

Item: Kits

	Bakey & Taylor					Mackin Educational Resources					Follett School Solutions				
Background and Financial Stability	0.0					48.0					47.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	8.0	10.0	10.0	8.0	9.0	10.0
Experience with Like Projects	0.0					71.0					75.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						13.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	13.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	15.0	15.0
Quality of Proposed Solutions/ Availability of Library Books/Materials	0.0					109.0					110.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						25.0	25.0	22.0	15.0	22.0	23.0	25.0	25.0	15.0	22.0
Cost	0.0					200.0					40.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						40.00	40.00	40.00	40.00	40.00	8.0	8.0	8.0	8.0	8.0
Ability to Meet Vendor Requirements	0.0					50.0					49.0				
	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5	1	2	3	4	5
						10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	9.0	10.0	10.0	10.0	10.0
References	Pass					Pass					Pass				
Notes	NO BID ON THIS ITEM														
Total Points	0.0					478.0					321.0				

The number assigned to the evaluator is listed above their score. Cost points are calculated by Procurement with maximum points assigned to the lowest cost and a weighted assignment to the rest.

Awarded Vendor(s) Mackin Educational Resources
Follett School Solutions

Perma Bound Failed due to CCS