



**Final Tabulation
RFB 5802 Busing Services for Summer Transportation
Opening Date: June 1, 2022**

Appendix C.1

Group A: EXTENDED SCHOOL YEAR (ESY) with CLUB RECREATION PROGRAM

Sites	Program	Type of Bus	First Student, Inc.	Lakeside Buses of Wisconsin, Inc.	Lamers Bus Lines, Inc.	Durham School Services, L.P.	North America Central School Bus dba Illinois Central School Bus, LLC
Gaenslen	EXTENDED SCHOOL YEAR (ESY)	Orthopedic Bus cost for single tier run	\$ 300.00	no bid	\$ 332.00	no bid	no bid
		Orthopedic Cost for paired tier run	\$ 500.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
		Small Bus cost for single tier run	\$ 240.00	\$ 395.00	\$ 332.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 324.44
		Small Bus Cost for paired tier run	\$ 400.00	\$ 520.00	no bid	\$ 450.00	\$ 540.60
	CLUB RECREATION	Orthopedic Bus cost for single tier run	\$ 300.00	no bid	\$ 332.00	no bid	no bid
		Small Bus cost for single tier run	\$ 240.00	\$ 198.00	no bid	\$ 250.00	\$ 162.22
MACL	EXTENDED SCHOOL YEAR (ESY)	Orthopedic Bus cost for single tier run	\$ 300.00	no bid	\$ 332.00	no bid	no bid
		Orthopedic Cost for paired tier run	\$ 500.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
		Small Bus cost for single tier run	\$ 240.00	\$ 395.00	\$ 332.00	\$ 300.00	no bid
		Small Bus Cost for paired tier run	\$ 400.00	\$ 520.00	no bid	\$ 450.00	no bid
	CLUB RECREATION	Orthopedic Bus cost for single tier run	\$ 300.00	no bid	\$ 332.00	no bid	no bid
		Small Bus cost for single tier run	\$ 240.00	\$ 198.00	no bid	\$ 250.00	no bid
Clement	EXTENDED SCHOOL YEAR (ESY)	Orthopedic Bus cost for single tier run	\$ 300.00	no bid	\$ 332.00	no bid	no bid
		Orthopedic Cost for paired tier run	\$ 500.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
		Small Bus cost for single tier run	\$ 240.00	\$ 395.00	\$ 332.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 324.44
		Small Bus Cost for paired tier run	\$ 400.00	\$ 520.00	no bid	\$ 450.00	\$ 540.60
	CLUB RECREATION	Orthopedic Bus cost for single tier run	\$ 300.00	no bid	\$ 332.00	no bid	no bid
		Small Bus cost for single tier run	\$ 240.00	\$ 198.00	no bid	\$ 250.00	\$ 162.22
WCLL	EXTENDED SCHOOL YEAR (ESY)	Orthopedic Bus cost for single tier run	\$ 300.00	no bid	\$ 332.00	no bid	no bid
		Orthopedic Cost for paired tier run	\$ 500.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
		Small Bus cost for single tier run	\$ 240.00	\$ 395.00	\$ 332.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 324.44
		Small Bus Cost for paired tier run	\$ 400.00	\$ 520.00	no bid	\$ 450.00	\$ 540.60
	CLUB RECREATION	Orthopedic Bus cost for single tier run	\$ 300.00	no bid	\$ 332.00	no bid	no bid
		Small Bus cost for single tier run	\$ 240.00	\$ 198.00	no bid	\$ 250.00	\$ 162.22

Maximum Total Number of Orthopedically Equipped Small Buses Available on Any Day	21	0	3	15	0
---	-----------	----------	----------	-----------	----------

**Specific locations awarded to three vendors, as indicated by highlight →

Awarded to:

First Student, Inc.

Lakeside Buses of Wisconsin, Inc.

Durham School Services, L.P.

North America Central School Bus dba Illinois Central School Bus, LLC



**MILWAUKEE
PUBLIC SCHOOLS**

**Final Tabulation
RFB 5802 Busing Services for Summer Transportation
Opening Date: June 1, 2022**

Appendix C.2
Group C & D: CLUB RECREATION FIELD TRIPS & SUMMER ACADEMY FIELD TRIPS

Sites / Address	First Student, Inc.	Lakeside Buses of Wisconsin, Inc.	Lamers Bus Lines, Inc.	Durham School Services, L.P.	North America Central School Bus dba Illinois Central School Bus, LLC
AMF Bowlero					
Cost per Large Bus	\$ 360.00	\$ 320.00	\$ 304.50	\$ 250.00	\$ 172.74
Cost per Small Bus	\$ 320.00	\$ 320.00	\$ 304.50	\$ 250.00	\$ 172.74
Cost for Wheel Chair Bus	\$ 400.00	no bid	\$ 304.50	no bid	no bid
AMC Theaters					
Cost per Large Bus	\$ 360.00	\$ 320.00	\$ 263.90	\$ 250.00	\$ 152.74
Cost per Small Bus	\$ 320.00	\$ 320.00	\$ 263.90	\$ 250.00	\$ 152.74
Cost for Wheel Chair Bus	\$ 400.00	no bid	\$ 263.90	no bid	no bid
Betty Brinn					
Cost per Large Bus	\$ 360.00	\$ 320.00	\$ 284.20	\$ 250.00	\$ 152.74
Cost per Small Bus	\$ 320.00	\$ 320.00	\$ 284.20	\$ 250.00	\$ 152.74
Cost for Wheel Chair Bus	\$ 400.00	no bid	\$ 284.20	no bid	no bid
Cool Waters					
Cost per Large Bus	\$ 360.00	\$ 320.00	no bid	\$ 250.00	\$ 152.74
Cost per Small Bus	\$ 320.00	\$ 320.00	no bid	\$ 250.00	\$ 152.74
Cost for Wheel Chair Bus	\$ 400.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
Festa Italiana					
Cost per Large Bus	\$ 360.00	\$ 320.00	\$ 324.80	\$ 250.00	\$ 152.74
Cost per Small Bus	\$ 320.00	\$ 320.00	\$ 324.80	\$ 250.00	\$ 152.74
Cost for Wheel Chair Bus	\$ 400.00	no bid	\$ 324.80	no bid	no bid
Hawthorn Glen					
Cost per Large Bus	\$ 360.00	\$ 320.00	\$ 406.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 152.74
Cost per Small Bus	\$ 320.00	\$ 320.00	\$ 406.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 152.74
Cost for Wheel Chair Bus	\$ 400.00	no bid	\$ 406.00	no bid	no bid
Kayla's Playground					
Cost per Large Bus	\$ 360.00	\$ 320.00	\$ 406.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 164.72
Cost per Small Bus	\$ 320.00	\$ 320.00	\$ 406.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 164.72
Cost for Wheel Chair Bus	\$ 400.00	no bid	\$ 406.00	no bid	no bid
Lakeshore Park					
Cost per Large Bus	\$ 360.00	\$ 640.00	\$ 406.00	no bid	\$ 152.74
Cost per Small Bus	\$ 320.00	\$ 640.00	\$ 406.00	no bid	\$ 152.74
Cost for Wheel Chair Bus	\$ 400.00	no bid	\$ 406.00	no bid	no bid
Milwaukee County Zoo					
Cost per Large Bus	\$ 360.00	\$ 320.00	\$ 466.60	\$ 250.00	\$ 152.74
Cost per Small Bus	\$ 320.00	\$ 320.00	\$ 466.60	\$ 250.00	\$ 152.74
Cost for Wheel Chair Bus	\$ 400.00	no bid	\$ 466.60	no bid	no bid
Milwaukee Public Museum					
Cost per Large Bus	\$ 360.00	\$ 320.00	\$ 446.60	\$ 250.00	\$ 152.74
Cost per Small Bus	\$ 320.00	\$ 320.00	\$ 446.60	\$ 250.00	\$ 152.74
Cost for Wheel Chair Bus	\$ 400.00	no bid	\$ 446.60	no bid	no bid
Southgate Cinema					
Cost per Large Bus	\$ 360.00	\$ 320.00	\$ 284.20	\$ 250.00	\$ 152.74
Cost per Small Bus	\$ 320.00	\$ 320.00	\$ 284.20	\$ 250.00	\$ 152.74
Cost for Wheel Chair Bus	\$ 400.00	no bid	\$ 284.20	no bid	no bid
Wehr Nature Center					
Cost per Large Bus	\$ 360.00	\$ 320.00	\$ 324.80	\$ 250.00	\$ 184.72
Cost per Small Bus	\$ 320.00	\$ 320.00	\$ 324.80	\$ 250.00	\$ 184.72
Cost for Wheel Chair Bus	\$ 400.00	no bid	\$ 324.80	no bid	no bid

**Specific locations awarded to three vendors, as indicated by highlight →

Awarded to:

First Student, Inc.

Lamers Bus Lines, Inc.

North America Central School Bus dba Illinois Central School Bus, LLC



**MILWAUKEE
PUBLIC SCHOOLS**

**Final Tabulation
RFB 5802 Busing Services for Summer Transportation
Opening Date: June 1, 2022**

Appendix C.3

Group E: Bruce Harris Playground Series

Location	Bus Size	First Student, Inc.	Lakeside Buses of Wisconsin, Inc.	Lamers Bus Lines, Inc.	Durham School Services, L.P.	North America Central School Bus dba Illinois Central School Bus, LLC
Bruce Harris Playground League	Flat Rate Cost, Per Bus, Per Day 65 Passenger Bus	no bid	\$ 400.00	\$ 412.40	no bid	no bid

****Specific locations awarded to three vendors, as indicated by highlight →**

Awarded to:

Lakeside Buses of Wisconsin, Inc.

No bids received from:

First Student, Inc.

Durham School Services, L.P.

North America Central School Bus dba Illinois Central School Bus, LLC



**MILWAUKEE
PUBLIC SCHOOLS**

**Final Tabulation
RFB 5802 Busing Services for Summer Transportation
Opening Date: June 1, 2022**

Appendix C.4
Group F: Summer CLC Excel Program

Location	First Student, Inc.	Lakeside Buses of Wisconsin, Inc.	Lamers Bus Lines, Inc.	Durham School Services, L.P.	North America Central School Bus dba Illinois Central School Bus, LLC
Juneau Campus					
Small Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 223.11
Large Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 223.11
Riverside High School					
Small Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day	\$ 320.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 223.11
Large Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day	\$ 360.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 223.11
Madison High School					
Small Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day	\$ 320.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 243.11
Large Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day	\$ 360.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 243.11
VHD Institute of Cosmetology					
Small Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day	\$ 320.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 243.11
Large Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day	\$ 360.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 243.11
Harley Museum					
Small Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day	\$ 320.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 223.11
Large Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day	\$ 360.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 223.11
Bradford Beach					
Small Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day	\$ 320.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 223.11
Large Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day	\$ 360.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 223.11
Discovery World					
Small Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day	\$ 320.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 223.11
Large Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day	\$ 360.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 223.11
Gordon Park					
Small Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day	\$ 320.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 223.11
Large Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day	\$ 360.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 223.11
Madam Chino's Shop					
Small Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 223.11
Large Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 223.11
Goodwill Store					
Small Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day	\$ 320.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 243.11
Large Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day	\$ 360.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 243.11
MIAD - Milwaukee Institute of Art & Design					
Small Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day	\$ 320.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 446.21
Large Bus Flat Rate, Per Bus, Per Day	\$ 360.00	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 446.21

**Specific locations awarded to three vendors, as indicated by highlight



Awarded to:

First Student, Inc.
North America Central School Bus dba Illinois Central School Bus, LLC

No bids received from:

Lakeside Buses of Wisconsin, Inc.
Lamers Bus Lines, Inc.
Durham School Services, L.P.



**MILWAUKEE
PUBLIC SCHOOLS**

**Final Tabulation
RFB 5802 Busing Services for Summer Transportation
Opening Date: June 1, 2022**

Appendix C.5
Group G: Summer Stars Teen Program

Location	Bus Size	First Student, Inc.	Lakeside Buses of Wisconsin, Inc.	Lamers Bus Lines, Inc.	Durham School Services, L.P.	North America Central School Bus dba Illinois Central School Bus, LLC
Summer Stars Shuttle	Flat Rate Cost, Per Bus, Per Day 65 Passenger Bus	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid

No bids received from:

First Student, Inc.

Lakeside Buses of Wisconsin, Inc.

Lamers Bus Lines, Inc.

Durham School Services, L.P.

North America Central School Bus dba Illinois Central School Bus, LLC



**MILWAUKEE
PUBLIC SCHOOLS**

**Final Tabulation
RFB 5802 Busing Services for Summer Transportation
Opening Date: June 1, 2022**

Appendix C.6
Group H: Summer Playground Traveling Adventures

Location	Bus Size	First Student, Inc.	Lakeside Buses of Wisconsin, Inc.	Lamers Bus Lines, Inc.	Durham School Services, L.P.	North America Central School Bus dba Illinois Central School Bus, LLC
Stonefire Pizza	Flat Rate Cost, Per Bus, Per Round Trip to and from Playground Sites, 65 Passenger Bus	no bid	\$ 400.00	\$ 324.80	\$ 250.00	\$ 198.57
Kids in Motion	Flat Rate Cost, Per Bus, Per Round Trip to and from Playground Sites, 65 Passenger Bus	no bid	\$ 400.00	\$ 243.60	\$ 250.00	\$ 168.57
Wisconsin Brewing Company Park	Flat Rate Cost, Per Bus, Per Round Trip to and from Playground Sites, 65 Passenger Bus	no bid	\$ 640.00	\$ 243.60	\$ 250.00	\$ 168.57
American Family Field	Flat Rate Cost, Per Bus, Per Round Trip to and from Playground Sites, 65 Passenger Bus	\$ 360.00	\$ 640.00	no bid	\$ 250.00	\$ 168.57
Franklin Field	Flat Rate Cost, Per Bus, Per Round Trip to and from Playground Sites, 65 Passenger Bus	\$ 360.00	\$ 640.00	\$ 243.60	\$ 250.00	\$ 168.57
Cool Waters Outdoor Pool	Flat Rate Cost, Per Bus, Per Round Trip to and from Playground Sites, 65 Passenger Bus	\$ 360.00	\$ 640.00	no bid	\$ 250.00	\$ 168.57
Brown Deer Pond	Flat Rate Cost, Per Bus, Per Round Trip to and from Playground Sites, 65 Passenger Bus	\$ 360.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 324.80	\$ 250.00	\$ 188.57
David F Schultz Aquatic Center	Flat Rate Cost, Per Bus, Per Round Trip to and from Playground Sites, 65 Passenger Bus	no bid	\$ 640.00	\$ 343.60	\$ 250.00	\$ 168.57
JB's on 41	Flat Rate Cost, Per Bus, Per Round Trip to and from Playground Sites, 65 Passenger Bus	\$ 360.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 324.80	\$ 250.00	\$ 168.57
Bowlero Wauwatosa	Flat Rate Cost, Per Bus, Per Round Trip to and from Playground Sites, 65 Passenger Bus	\$ 360.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 304.50	\$ 250.00	\$ 188.57
Milwaukee County Zoo	Flat Rate Cost, Per Bus, Per Round Trip to and from Playground Sites, 65 Passenger Bus	\$ 360.00	\$ 640.00	\$ 466.60	\$ 250.00	\$ 168.57
Bounce Milwaukee	Flat Rate Cost, Per Bus, Per Round Trip to and from Playground Sites, 65 Passenger Bus	\$ 360.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 243.60	\$ 250.00	\$ 168.57
Milwaukee Public Museum	Flat Rate Cost, Per Bus, Per Round Trip to and from Playground Sites, 65 Passenger Bus	\$ 360.00	\$ 640.00	\$ 446.60	\$ 250.00	\$ 168.57
Betty Brinn Children's Museum	Flat Rate Cost, Per Bus, Per Round Trip to and from Playground Sites, 65 Passenger Bus	\$ 360.00	\$ 640.00	\$ 284.20	\$ 250.00	\$ 168.57

**Specific locations awarded to three vendors, as indicated by highlight



Awarded to:

North America Central School Bus dba Illinois Central School Bus, LLC