



**Final Tabulation
B 5800 Busing Transportation for Athletics Academic Competitions, & After-School Activities
Opening Date: June 13, 2022**

**Exhibit B
Group A: High Schools**

School / Size / School Day	First Student, Inc.		North America Central School Bus dba Illinois Central School Bus, LLC		Durham School Services, L.P.		Safeway Transportation Services Corporation	
	Cost Per Hour +	Cost Per Mile	Cost Per Hour +	Cost Per Mile	Cost Per Hour +	Cost Per Mile	Cost Per Hour +	Cost Per Mile
Audubon / S / 8:00 am – 3:25 pm	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 68.00	\$ 1.85	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 84.00	\$ 1.54
Bay View-WCLL / B / 8:00 am – 3:25 pm	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 68.00	\$ 1.85	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 84.00	\$ 1.54
Bradley Tech / B / 8:00 am – 3:25 pm	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 68.00	\$ 1.85	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 84.00	\$ 1.54
SCTE (Custer) / B / 8:00 am – 3:25 pm	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 84.00	\$ 1.54
Hamilton / B / 8:00 am – 3:25 pm	\$ 90.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 68.00	\$ 1.85	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 84.00	\$ 1.54
King / B / 8:00 am – 3:25 pm	\$ 90.00	\$ 1.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 84.00	\$ 1.54
MacDowell / S / 8:00 am – 3:25 pm	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 84.00	\$ 1.54
Marshall-MSOL / B / 8:00 am – 3:25 pm	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 64.00	\$ 1.25	\$ 84.00	\$ 1.54
Madison / B / 8:00 am – 3:25 pm	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 64.00	\$ 1.25	\$ 84.00	\$ 1.54
MHSA/Pulaski / B / 8:00 am – 3:25 pm	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 68.00	\$ 1.85	\$ 64.00	\$ 1.25	\$ 84.00	\$ 1.54
North / S / 8:00 am – 3:25 pm	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 84.00	\$ 1.54
Riverside-Golda Meir / B / 8:00 am – 3:25 pm	\$ 90.00	\$ 1.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 84.00	\$ 1.54
Reagan Prep / B / 8:00 am – 3:25 pm	\$ 90.00	\$ 1.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 84.00	\$ 1.54
South / B / 8:00 am – 3:25 pm	\$ 90.00	\$ 1.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 84.00	\$ 1.54
Vincent / B / 8:00 am – 3:25 pm	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 84.00	\$ 1.54
Washington Multiplex / B / 8:00 am – 3:25 pm	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 64.00	\$ 1.25	\$ 84.00	\$ 1.54

**Specific locations awarded to four vendors, as indicated by highlight



Group B: Middle Schools

School / Size / Bus Needs	First Student, Inc.		North America Central School Bus dba Illinois Central School Bus, LLC		Durham School Services, L.P.		Safeway Transportation Services Corporation	
	Cost Per Hour +	Cost Per Mile	Cost Per Hour +	Cost Per Mile	Cost Per Hour +	Cost Per Mile	Cost Per Hour +	Cost Per Mile
Audubon / S / 4:30pm – 6:30pm	\$ 80.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 68.00	\$ 1.85	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 84.00	\$ 1.54
Lincoln / B / 4:30pm – 6:30pm	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 84.00	\$ 1.54
Roosevelt / B / 4:30pm – 6:30pm	\$ 90.00	\$ 1.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 84.00	\$ 1.54
Wedgewood / S / 4:30pm – 6:30pm	\$ 80.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 68.00	\$ 1.85	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 84.00	\$ 1.54

**Specific locations awarded to two vendors, as indicated by highlight



Group B: Middle Schools (continued)

School / Size / Bus Needs	First Student, Inc.		North America Central School Bus dba Illinois Central School Bus, LLC		Durham School Services, L.P.		Safeway Transportation Services Corporation	
	Cost Per Hour +	Cost Per Mile	Cost Per Hour +	Cost Per Mile	Cost Per Hour +	Cost Per Mile	Cost Per Hour +	Cost Per Mile
Franklin / S / 4:30pm – 8:00pm	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 84.00	\$ 1.54
Greenfield / S / 4:30pm – 8:00pm	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 84.00	\$ 1.54
Hamilton-Sussex / S / 4:30pm – 8:00pm	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 84.00	\$ 1.54
Shorewood / S / 4:30pm – 8:00pm	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 84.00	\$ 1.54
South Milwaukee / S / 4:30pm – 8:00pm	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 84.00	\$ 1.54
Wauwatosa / S / 4:30pm – 8:00pm	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 84.00	\$ 1.54
Whitefish Bay / S / 4:30pm – 8:00pm	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 84.00	\$ 1.54
Whitnall / S / 4:30pm – 8:00pm	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 84.00	\$ 1.54

**Specific locations awarded to one vendor, as indicated by highlight



Awarded to:
First Student, Inc.
North America Central School Bus dba Illinois Central
School Bus, LLC
Durham School Services, L.P.
Safeway Transportation Services Corporation