



**Final Bid Tabulation
RFB 5799 Mid-Day Transportation Services
Date Due: June 10, 2022**

NORTH REGION: COUNTY LINE RD-CAPITOL DR

Item #	Item Description	First Student, Inc.	Lakeside Buses of Wisconsin, Inc.	Lamers Bus Lines, Inc.	North America Central School Bus dba Illinois Central School Bus, LLC	Safeway Transportation Services Corporation
1	Single Tier (1 run per day)	\$ 120.00	\$ 155.00	No Bid	\$ 91.04	\$ 174.08
2	Paired Tier (2 runs per day)	\$ 200.00	\$ 285.00	No Bid	\$ 182.08	\$ 223.14
Total of Extended Line Items		\$ 320.00	\$ 440.00	No Bid	\$ 273.12	\$ 397.22
Number of Buses Offered:		30	30	0	5	30

Awarded to: First Student, Inc. & North America Central School Bus dba Illinois Central School Bus, LLC

CENTRAL REGION: CAPITOL DR-I94 FREEWAY

Item #	Item Description	First Student, Inc.	Lakeside Buses of Wisconsin, Inc.	Lamers Bus Lines, Inc.	North America Central School Bus dba Illinois Central School Bus, LLC	Safeway Transportation Services Corporation
1	Single Tier (1 run per day)	\$ 120.00	\$ 300.00	No Bid	\$ 89.30	\$ 174.08
2	Paired Tier (2 runs per day)	\$ 200.00	\$ 200.00	No Bid	\$ 178.60	\$ 223.14
Total of Extended Line Items		\$ 320.00	\$ 500.00	No Bid	\$ 267.90	\$ 397.22
Number of Buses Offered:		30	20	0	5	40

Awarded to: First Student, Inc., North America Central School Bus dba Illinois Central School Bus, LLC, Safeway Transportation Services Corporation

SOUTH REGION: I94 FREEWAY-GRANGE AVE

Item #	Item Description	First Student, Inc.	Lakeside Buses of Wisconsin, Inc.	Lamers Bus Lines, Inc.	North America Central School Bus dba Illinois Central School Bus, LLC	Safeway Transportation Services Corporation
1	Single Tier (1 run per day)	\$ 120.00	No Bid	\$ 129.38	\$ 86.70	\$ 174.08
2	Paired Tier (2 runs per day)	\$ 200.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 173.40	\$ 223.14
Total of Extended Line Items		\$ 320.00	No Bid	\$ 129.38	\$ 260.10	\$ 397.22
Number of Buses Offered:		30	0	30	35	30

Awarded to: North America Central School Bus dba Illinois Central School Bus, LLC