MILWAUKEE
PUBLIC SCHOOLS

B 5710 Chromebooks and associated Charging Carts, Blanket Contract
Opening Date: May 6, 2014

Camera
Corner Paragon Riverside  Troxell Comm-  Vanguard
Best Buy Connecting CDW Govern- Insight Public Development Technologies, unications, Compuers,
Description For Business Point ment LLC Sector, Inc. Systems, Inc. Inc. Inc. Inc.
Discount 0% Net 0% 30 0%0 Net Net 0%30 Net
Award A
Al. Chromebook 3,119,520.00 3,078,000.00 2,940,000.00 3,030,120.00
A2. Chromebook with Touchscreen 159,940.00 153,453.00 147,750.00 150,820.00
A3. Configuration Service 334,375.00 73,750.00 162,500.00 125,000.00
A4. Chrome OS Management 106,250.00 346,250.00 300,000.00 331,250.00
Award A Grand Total 3,720,085.00 3,651,450.00 3,550,250.00 No bid Non-complying No bid Non-complying  3,637,190.00
Award B
B1. Chromebook Charging Cart 618,756.00 582,000.00 538,000.00 648,796.00 625,240.00 570,000.00 451,812.00 No bid
Award B Grand Total 618,756.00 582,000.00 538,000.00 648,796.00 625,240.00 570,000.00 451,812.00 No bid

Awarded to:
CDW Government LLC for Award A
No Award for Award B

Non- Complying bids received from:
EarthWalk Communications, Inc.

Ewiz Express Corporation (DBA Superbiiz)
Paragon Development Systems, Inc. for Award A

Porcellis Technology Inc

Troxell Communications, Inc. for Award A



