



**MILWAUKEE
PUBLIC SCHOOLS**

**Final Tabulation
B 5737 Busing Transportation for the Extended School Year, Summer
Academy, Club Recreation and Super Site CLC Programs
Opening Date: April 14, 2016**

Appendix C.1

Group A: Special Education Extended School Year (ESY)

Sites	Lakeside Buses of Wisconsin, Inc.	Lamers Bus Lines, Inc.
	Cost per Route	Cost per Route
Elm Creative Arts School	No Bid	\$ 93.47
Vincent High School	No Bid	\$ 93.47
Clement Avenue School	No Bid	\$ 93.47
Milwaukee Academy of Chinese Language	No Bid	\$ 93.47
Community Assessment and Training Program (CATP) Sites	\$ 200.00	\$ 93.47
Maximum Total Number of 15-35 Passenger Buses Available on Any Day	5	55 Non-Wheelchair Units

****Specific site locations awarded to one vendor, as indicated by highlight →**



**MILWAUKEE
PUBLIC SCHOOLS**

**Final Tabulation
B 5737 Busing Transportation for the Extended School Year, Summer
Academy, Club Recreation and Super Site CLC Programs
Opening Date: April 14, 2016**

Appendix C.2
Group B: Summer Academy Super Site Programs

Sites	Lakeside Buses of Wisconsin, Inc.	Lamers Bus Lines, Inc.
	Cost per Route	Cost per Route
Grantosa Elementary School	\$ 200.00	\$ 93.47
Sherman Elementary School	\$ 200.00	\$ 93.47
Maximum Total Number of 36-72 Passenger Buses Available on Any Day	No Limit	125

**Specific site locations awarded to one vendor, as indicated by highlight →



**MILWAUKEE
PUBLIC SCHOOLS**

**Final Tabulation
B 5737 Busing Transportation for the Extended School Year, Summer
Academy, Club Recreation and Super Site CLC Programs
Opening Date: April 14, 2016**

Appendix C.3
Group C: Therapeutic Recreation Club Rec Program

Sites	Lakeside Buses of Wisconsin, Inc.	Lamers Bus Lines, Inc.
	Cost per Route	Cost per Route
Elm Creative Arts School	No Bid	\$ 46.75
Vincent High School	No Bid	\$ 46.75
Clement Avenue School	No Bid	\$ 46.75
Maximum Total Number of 15-35 Passenger Buses Available on Any Day	No Bid	55 Non-Wheelchair Units

****Specific site locations awarded to one vendor, as indicated by highlight →**



**MILWAUKEE
PUBLIC SCHOOLS**

**Final Tabulation
B 5737 Busing Transportation for the Extended School Year, Summer
Academy, Club Recreation and Super Site CLC Programs
Opening Date: April 14, 2016**

Appendix C.4
Group D: Therapeutic Recreation Club Rec - Field Trips

Bus Size	Lakeside Buses of Wisconsin, Inc.	Lamers Bus Lines, Inc.
	Cost Per Round Trip	Cost Per Round Trip
15-35 Passenger Bus	No Bid	\$ 91.00
36-72 Passenger Bus	\$50.00 an hour with 4 hour minimum	\$ 91.00
Maximum Total Number of 15-35 Passenger Buses Available on Any Day	No Bid	55 Non-Wheelchair Units
Maximum Total Number of 36-72 Passenger Buses Available on Any Day	No Limit	125

**Specific bus sizes awarded to one vendor, as indicated by highlight  



**MILWAUKEE
PUBLIC SCHOOLS**

**Final Tabulation
B 5737 Busing Transportation for the Extended School Year, Summer
Academy, Club Recreation and Super Site CLC Programs
Opening Date: April 14, 2016**

Appendix C.5
Group E: Summer Academy Super Site CLC Programs

Sites	Lakeside Buses of Wisconsin, Inc.	Lamers Bus Lines, Inc.
	Cost per Route	Cost per Route
Grantosa Elementary School	\$ 200.00	\$ 46.75
Sherman Elementary School	\$ 200.00	\$ 46.75
Maximum Total Number of 36-72 Passenger Buses Available on Any Day	No Limit	125

****Specific site locations awarded to one vendor, as indicated by highlight →**